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TRANSMISSION ONE 
 

We are aware that inner transformation requires dedicated work and 
effort on the part of the Trustee, and that, even though you have recognized 
and are dealing with the Illusion’s impact on your Personality, every one of 
our Trustees is experiencing Fourth-dimensional awakening on different 
levels. Your purpose in this Life-experience is to understand and destroy all 
those things that your Illusional Personality uses to prevent your 
transformation in consciousness beyond the Fourth-dimension. 

For example, it is said that when a person dies from drowning their whole 
life passes before their consciousness in an instant, involving both good and 
bad experiences. Now, the same situation occurs for everyone, following the 
death of their body. 

When this happens, nothing is hidden from consciousness. During their 
daily life humans constantly behave in a bad way, lying, and cheating others, 
and they appear not to be affected by their negative behavior. Of course, 
everyone is aware that what they are doing is wrong, but somehow pass it 
over. How is this? 

From early childhood the Personality begins to build a thick wall around 
their consciousness, and they do this to wall out conscience. On one side of 
the wall is their accepted bad behavior, and on the other side is the 
awareness that they are behaving badly. It’s living a divided life, a life of 
contradictions. When the body dies, this wall is broken down, and the 
Personality reveals to Essence the negative side of the life existence. 
Nothing is hidden, and all is retained in Essence’s memory, and the whole 
life immediately recurs. 

So you must realize that, now, as you strive to awaken your 
consciousness to the Personality’s behavior and begin to remove the bricks 
in the wall and confront these contradictions in your behavior, you must do 
this here and now in order that, on the death of your body, these 
contradictions will not exist, and you will not recur in the same circumstances 
again. 

This so called wall that you build begins when a child, and the bricks and 
mortar are best described as attitudes, which, in turn, are aligned to 
identification with these attitudes. You have your father’s, mother’s, and 



grandparent’s attitudes, plus all others you pick up on the way through 
education and later, when working and in your social activities. It can rightly 
be said that you are either your father’s or mother’s attitudes, but most likely 
it is a combination of both. Mostly, when you talk to someone and ask why 
they dislike something or someone’s behavior, they will not be able to give 
any particular reason except that they know that type of behavior is wrong. 
They do not believe they have an attitude, or that it was something learned 
from their parents. Unconscious attitudes allow individuals to behave in a 
negative and cruel manner and never feel bad about such behavior, and they 
will always justify their reasons for acting and talking that way. 

There are many important people who are always right, and aspire to be 
the leaders in the world. You will see these people in politics, in every country 
of the world. They have built very high and thick walls, and never feel any 
pangs of conscience from the other side of their wall. They lie, cheat, deny 
everything, create wars and financial upsets, all without any feeling of 
remorse. As well, they are artful in justifying their actions that are always 
done for the good of something. 

Of course, this type of personality is not limited to those involved in 
politics, but abounds in greater society; however, you will always find the 
greatest concentration of such people involved in politics at all levels of 
government. The higher and the thicker the wall, the more asleep the 
Personality and the greater their involvement in the Illusion. 

No one is immune from attitudes and identification. If I were to ask you 
what you are identified with at this present moment, you possibly could not 
answer because you are unaware that you are identified. Now, this is 
important for you to contemplate and observe because it means you are 
asleep. For this reason we constantly suggest that you have to be more 
observant of everything in your Personality, which includes all the many I’s 
that rule your life. So what is it that observes? A Personality “I” cannot 
observe itself. So there is something else that becomes the observer within 
your consciousness. 

I know many Trustees have struggled with the development of observing 
an I that is distinct from all the I’s of Illusional Personality. To make this plain, 
we need to have a distinction between Personality and Illusional Personality. 
We know that Illusional Personality is ruled by all the negative aspects of the 
world, and is mechanical in what it does, feels and thinks; whereas true 
Personality has little impact on life. True Personality has developed 
alongside Illusional Personality and functions in maintaining the body, and 
has developed life skills that relate to coping with life in the environment: 
particular work skills, general hygiene, and everything that relates to 



functioning in Nature. Illusional Personality, though, thrives on self-
importance, pride, vanity, and all the negative aspects of life that engender 
fame, wealth and control over others as well as the environment. In other 
words, Illusional Personality dominates living. 

When you destroy Illusional Personality, you are left with a Personality 
that is capable of living and working to maintain its existence in the natural 
order, a Personality that has no attitudes, identification or negative traits. It 
is perfectly ready to develop its existence with Essence, and express the 
Light of Essence for the Earth. 

We will now return to the development of the Observing I that you have to 
create in the true Personality, as distinct from the Illusional Personality and 
all its I’s. The observing I will eventually become your only I and it is created 
through your studies of the Transmissions and the application of what you 
have learned. You know that the Transmissions are distinct and separate 
from the Illusion, because they come from a higher source. The 
Transmissions represent the higher consciousness that exists in Being 
beyond the Illusion and this Dimension. Through your studies you are 
manifesting the Light knowledge into the dimension through true Personality 
as distinct from Illusional Personality. In fact, they are both existing and 
developing separately in the world. However, for anyone who has not been 
drawn to the Inner Teachings, their Life will only display the Illusional 
Personality, 

As you increase your knowledge and understanding of the higher truths 
and apply them to your life, they become the observing I in true Personality. 
The I observes all the negative I’s – their attitudes, emotions, and so on – 
and eventually, over a long period, will destroy their effect on your 
consciousness. Your observing I observes, and records what it sees in its 
memory, which grows by the day. It is not critical of what it observes, but 
increases the memory of the actions of Illusional Personality. Now here an 
interesting thing occurs. All the stored memories are utilized by Essence. 
This is the transformation. We have said that Essence has to develop in 
power and destroy Illusional Personality. With the development of a 
permanent I in Personality, Essence utilizes the memories to eliminate the 
power of the various I’s in Illusional Personality, and, in turn, destroys the 
function of Illusional Personality. Now you begin to ascend to the higher 
levels of the Fourth-dimension and into the Light of the Kingdom of which Ma 
Kwa taught. 

From this you will realize why we have focused on remembering and 
observation during your study in these two Series. Every effort you make 
daily, no matter how small, will increase your transformation. But you have 



to consciously do something daily. We have not discussed true Personality 
previously in the Transmissions because, at that stage, it would have 
confused your developing knowledge of the Illusion and its hold over 
Personality. We concentrated on learning how Illusional Personality 
develops from childhood, and how Essence is restricted and denied its 
function through the body. It is important that you realize the full impact of 
the Illusion before you can know how to destroy its hold over your 
consciousness. 

Does this make your work on self any easier? Yes, it does, because you 
realize the importance the Transmissions have in your life and ultimate 
freedom. The Transmissions contain the elements of truth from the higher 
level of consciousness, which, when applied correctly, will transform your 
Personality. And what is the ultimate purpose for you? It is to work to 
transform the Earth’s consciousness. You leave behind all your personal 
desires for greatness and importance, and live unselfishly to fulfil the needs 
of the Earth and its Personality. 

I would like you to consider the following in your contemplation. In this 
Transmission we have shown how true Personality functions in accordance 
with Illusional Personality, fulfilling the needs of the Earth. If you are unable 
to recognize this part of Personality because of the dominance of the 
Illusional Personality, then observe the lives and functions of the other 
animals. Recognize their application of Personality, which is free of the effect 
of the Illusion, and how they live through and with Nature. This is what your 
Personality would be doing if there were no Illusion. However, the Illusion 
has provided the means whereby humanity has to struggle to add to 
Personality the higher Light that works for the Earth, and is something that 
will eventually be added to all other organisms. 

Finally, I want to direct your consciousness to the relationship of evolution 
and the inner way. As you know from your studies with these Transmissions, 
Zadore has said there is no such thing as evolution within the Creative 
Universe, that everything that manifests is perfect in its own being. However, 
because humanity lives in the Illusion of Personality, which is imperfect, they 
believe that this aspect of Personality is changing and evolving into 
something different and important. But this cannot be a reality, because it is 
an aspect of Personality based on negativity. 

The concept of evolution has been woven into many esoteric religions and 
occult groups, over many thousands of years, and it is obvious that their 
teachings are based on the ideas propounded by the Illusion. Their confusion 
revolves around the belief in an eternal soul, and is the result of the early 
thinking and teachings of the Greek Philosophers. Quickly the early Christian 



Religion added the Neo Platonic teachings to support and expand their 
doctrines, and the soul became an integral part of their teachings, and with 
it the evolution of the soul in man. Later, those mystics who founded different 
Orders and Societies, continued to support the idea of evolution of the soul. 
Later, science applied the same principle to the evolution of the body. 

We may ask what is the difference between people who lived three 
thousand years ago and those of the present century? Generally the answer 
is that humanity has evolved from a peasant society to one that is an 
enlightened technological one. But, inwardly, nothing has changed because 
humanity still expresses the same negativity, is jealous and vain, selfish and 
greedy; in fact, they are unchanged inwardly. 

If you are to believe in evolution and cause and effect, then there is no 
need for you to remember. Zadore states you have to remember; that is, 
remember what you are. To do this means that you already are, and that you 
cannot alter or change into something different. The esoteric orders suggest 
that humanity descended into matter and through evolution it must ascend, 
bringing with them worthwhile experiences. In effect, the concept here is 
correct, but the method of attainment is not taught. It is the development of 
true Personality that brings new experiences to Essence. Essence develops 
out of the higher truths that true Personality attaches to itself, and in turn 
adds this to Essence. It is as if Essence grows through its own being or 
consciousness. Zadore has said when this higher conscious knowledge that 
is given to mankind through the Transmissions and other sources, is added 
to the Intellectual Center, it begins to weaken Personality’s dependence on 
the Illusion. 

Often these sources of higher knowledge are utilized by those human 
beings, who over thousands of years have destroyed the Illusion in their 
Personality, and have moved their consciousness to the Fifth-dimension, 
and still constantly radiate the truths that belong to that dimension to 
struggling humanity. We know this occurs, but unfortunately, the actuality of 
it has been distorted by greedy Astral Entities who have invented the 
concepts of ascended Masters, Great White Brotherhoods, and an elite that 
actually rule the world. And we do know that the so-called elite consists of 
the bulk of these entities banded together, under beings such as Janix and 
Razparil. 

At this stage of your development these Entities have no power over your 
consciousness, which is shielded from their negative influences by the 
Vortex of Light and Healing. You should not dwell on their existence or the 
poison they inject into society, because you are free from their Illusion over 
your consciousness. 
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