
James

“For just as the body without the spirit is dead, 
so also faith without works is dead”.

James 2:26 NASB

Session One Memory Verse

James

“Consider it pure joy, my brothers, whenever 
you face trials of many kinds, because you 
know that the testing of your faith develops 
perseverance” 

James 1:2–3 NIV

James

“Whoever of you loves life and desires to see 
many good days, keep your tongue from evil 
and your lips from speaking lies.”

 
Psa. 34:12–13 NIV

 
Session Four Memory Verse

James

“Do not twist justice in legal matters by 
favoring the poor or being partial to the rich 
and powerful. Always judge people fairly.” 

Lev. 19:15 NLT

Session Three Memory Verse

James

“But the wisdom that comes from heaven is 
first of all pure. It is also peace loving, gentle at 
all times, and willing to yield to others. It is full 
of mercy and good deeds. It shows no partiality 
and is always sincere”

 James 3:17 NLT
Session Five Memory Verse

James

“Command those who are rich 
in this present world not to be arrogant nor to 
put their hope in wealth, which is so uncertain, 
but to put their hope in God, who richly pro-
vides us with everything for our enjoyment.”
 

1 Tim. 6:17 NIV

James

“What causes fights and quarrels among you? 
Don’t they come from your desires that battle 
within you?” 

James 4:1 NIV

James
“You have lived on earth in luxury and self-
indulgence. You have fattened yourselves in 
the day of slaughter. 6You have condemned 
and murdered innocent men, who were not 
opposing you.” 

James 5:5–6 NIV

James

“But the wisdom that comes from heaven is 
first of all pure; then peace-loving, considerate, 
submissive, full of mercy and good fruit, 
impartial and sincere.” 

James 3:17 NIV  

James

“Likewise the tongue is a small part of the 
body, but it makes great boasts. Consider what 
a great forest is set on fire by a small spark.” 

James 3:5 NIV
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