
Tilden Summer Camp 
 

Assumption of Risk, Waiver and Release Agreement 
 
I, the undersigned parent/legal guardian, have full legal responsibility for the decisions of the 
participant and consent to allow my son to participate in Tilden Summer Camp. I understand that 
if I have any risk concerns, I should discuss them with the director of Tilden Summer Camp prior 
to signing this Assumption of Risk, Waiver and Release Agreement and prior to any 
participation in Tilden Summer Camp.  

I certify that my son is in good health and have no physical condition that would prevent them 
from participating in any of the activities at Tilden Summer Camp.  If such a condition exists, I 
will notify the director of the camp. Further, I agree to use and make claims for, including but 
not limited to, any medical, health and workers compensation insurance that is available to my 
son if an accident or injury occurs and will not make any claims against the Company for same.  

I consent to allow emergency medical treatment if such care is required. I delegate authority to 
the Director of Tilden Summer Camp to arrange whatever medical treatment he (or his staff) 
deem necessary during my son’s stay at the camp. 

I agree that photographs, pictures, slides, movies, video, or other media coverage of my son may 
be taken in connection with my son’s participation in Tilden Summer Camp and hereby consent 
to the use of photographs, pictures, slides, movies, video or other media coverage for any legal 
purpose.  

Even though the staff of Tilden Summer Camp take great care to ensure the safety of all 
participants, I acknowledge that I fully understand participation in the camp may involve risk of 
serious injury or death, including losses which may result not only from their own actions, 
inactions or negligence, but also from the actions, inactions or negligence of others, the condition 
of the facilities, equipment or areas where the activity is being conducted and/or the rules of play 
of this type of activity.   

Based on my knowledge and understanding of the risk involved with my son’s participation in 
Tilden Summer Camp, I hereby voluntarily and willingly assume responsibility for all risks and 
dangers associated with my son’s participation in the camp. I agree that I am financially 
responsible for any losses resulting from my son’s actions during the participation of the camp. 

In consideration of my son’s participation in the camp, I hereby waive all claims and causes of 
action against Tilden Summer Camp, Inc. arising out of my son’s participation in the camp and 
hereby release Tilden Summer Camp, Inc from all liability in connection therewith. 

I have read this Assumption of Risk, Waiver and Release Agreement and understand the terms 
used in it and their legal significance.  This Assumption of Risk, Waiver and Release Agreement 
is freely and voluntarily given with the understanding that right to legal recourse against the 
Company is knowingly relinquished for the permitted participation in the camp.  My signature 
below is intended to also bind my or my son’s successors, heirs, representatives, administrators, 
and assigns. 


