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Twin-chamber ultrafiltration ensures 
maximum protection and refreshing taste


Cold water line enters the top 
of the cartridge directing water 
flow down through intake 
channel into the filtration 
chambers.
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Water flow through Granular 
Activated Carbon chambers 
purges out organic chemicals, 
including chlorine, VOCs and 
THMs.
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Ultrafiltration Membrane 
Chamber removes virtually all 
waterborne particulates down to 
the infinitesimal size of 0.5 
micron (1/50,000th of an inch), 
including lead, asbestos, fibers, 
and virulent parasitic cysts not 
killed by chlorination.
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Through Everpure’s exclusive 
precoat process, water flow 
automatically coats the unique 
filter membrane with Micropure, 
a proprietary laboratory formula 
incorporating pulverized 
activated carbon. 
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