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LIMITED WARRANTY  

We warrant our products against defects in workmanship, materials, or operation subject, of 
course, to ordinary wear and tear as it pertains to particular installations. However, we do not 
warrant against defects due to improper installation or failure to exercise normal maintenance, 
nor against the consequences of uses for which our products were not designed.  

Our only liability, whether in tort, or in contract under this warranty or any express or implied 
warranty, is to repair or replace products which are returned to us, shipping charges prepaid, at 
the address below within one year after our delivery thereof to the original purchaser from us, 
and are determined by us to be defective.  

We expect that our customers will inspect these products upon receipt. H damage has resulted 
from shipment, our customer's only remedy is by making claim against the carrier. Products will 
not be accepted for repair or replacement under this warranty unless we have given prior 
authorization for their return. Upon receipt of products returned for repair or replacement, we 
will determine whether products qualify for repair or replacement under this warranty; if they do 
not, we will notify our customer of estimated costs of repair or replacement involved and will 
obtain authorization prior to proceeding. We have no liability to pay any costs of repair 
performed by anyone other than us, unless in each instance we have given prior written approval 
of such repair in which case we will pay what we consider to be reasonable cost thereof.  

THIS WARRANTY IS IN LIEU OF ALL OTHER EXPRESS WARRANTIES. IMPLIED 
WARRANTIES SHALL BE LIMITED TO THE DURATION OF THE WARRANTY PERIOD 
OF THIS EXPRESS WARRANTY. WE SHALL UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES BE 
LIABLE FOR Incidental OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES. SOME STATES DO NOT 
ALLOW LIMITATIONS ON HOW LONG AN IMPLIED WARRANTY LASTS OR THE 
EXCLUSION OR LIMITATION OF INCIDENTAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES, SO 
THE ABOVE LIMITATION OR EXCLUSION MAY NOT APPLY TO YOU. THIS 
WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS AND YOU MAY ALSO HAVE 
OTHER RIGHTS WHICH VARY FROM STATE TO STATE.  

For information on Warranty Performance contact us at:  

Warranty Performance Department Period Brass  
31-35 Water Street P.O. Box 520  

Jamestown, NY 14702-0520 Tel: (800) 332-6677 
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