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Dermastir Hydraceutic Cream - 50ml

Alta Care Laboratoires has created Dermastir
Luxury Hydraceutic cream to hydrate deeply 
the skin and, at the same time, protect the 
skin from oxidative stress and other external 
agents that may compromise skin quality 
and condition.

The hydration provided by Dermastir Luxury
Hydraceutic cream is based on two 
synergistic factors: inner hydration and outer 
protection.

The ingredients retain their hydrating power 
at maximum due to the vacuum airless 
packaging that protects the hydrating 
ingredients inside the jar. At the same time, 
anti-oxidant ingredients shield the skin from 
dehydration and free radicals. JOJOBA SEED OIL

AVOCADO OIL

CAFFEINE

DERMASTIR HYDRACEUTIC CREAM

TOCOPHEROL (VITAMIN E)

The application is recommended every 
morning and ideally twice a day. Can be used 
before applying the make-up. Avoid eye 
contour area.

MADE IN FRANCE

ANTI WRINKLE

 DRY SKIN

ECZEMA, REDNESS

ANTIOXIDANT

OXIDATIVE STRESS



AIRLESS
PUMP TECHNOLOGY

Actuator Airless
Technology

Protects from 
bacteria

Metallic Reflecting
Technology

Protects  from infrared 
rays and radiant heat

Vacuum Flask
Technology

Protects  from 
conductive heat

Dermastir Hydraceutic Cream - 50ml

Free radicals are found in the environment in 
air pollutants, chemicals, smoke etc. Since 
the oxidative stress and the exposure to free 
radicals are hardly evitable, it is essential to 
minimize their damages to the skin. The 
solution is to increase proper level of 
antioxidants to combat effectively free 
radicals and form a protective barrier on the 
skin. 

Dermastir Luxury Hydraceutic cream is rich 
in ingredients with antioxidant properties, 
which perform as well brightening, soothing 
and smoothing action. The skin looks more 
revitalized, regenerated and refreshed. 
Dermastir Luxury Hydraceutic cream can be 
used daily as a part of beauty routine to 
protect and hydrate the skin. 

Protects from oxidation 

Oxygen
Airless jar protects from oxidation. The 

ingredients maintain their bioavailability 
from the first till the last application.

Metallic coating reflects infrared rays, 
protecting from the light and direct 

sun exposure.

The airless jar maintains its microclimate 
and pH level, protecting from the 

humidity.

Prevents the risk of microbiological 
contamination. The optimal amount is 

delivered with the pump. No need 
to touch the product.

Thermos effect. The airless packaging 
consists of 3 jars nested into 1, protecting 

from conductive heat.
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