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INTRODUCTION

Having a sauna in the privacy of your own 
home provides luxury as well as the health 
benefits for the body and spirit. Therefore, 
caring for its wood is vital in prolonging its 
life. 

There are different treatments that may be 
used to enhance the saunas wood, but the 
finest method is to apply Sauna Wood Oil 
by Scandia Manufacturing. 

• Restores old wood and keeps new wood 
looking refined

• 100% Organic: Contains no harsh chemicals 
or additives and is a non-toxic blend of 
aromatic oils and highly refined, food-grade, 
clear petroleum-based oil

• Cedar Scent

• Overlapping during application will not cause 
lap marks; One gallon will cover approximately 
600 to 800 sq. ft of surface area

• Interior and Exterior application

• Forms an attractive, subtle, glossy finish

• One US Gallon (3.8 liters) - Weight: 8 lbs 
(3.6 Kg)

FEATURES
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WITHOUT SCANDIA 
SAUNA WOOD OIL

WITH SCANDIA 
SAUNA WOOD OIL
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HOW IT WORKS

Step 1. Pre-heat Sauna to 90° F (32° C)

Step 2. Apply oil with natural bristle brush

Step 3. Heat sauna to 160° F (71° C) for 1 hour

SAUNA WOOD OIL

• Shake the bottle vigorously for 5 minutes 
before application

• Ensure the surface is clean and dry before 
application

• Apply in the direction of the grain with a 
natural bristle brush

• Apply generously if the sauna is old and has 
never been treated (less product will be 
needed if the sauna is new or has been pre-
viously treated with Sauna Wood Oil)

• Overlapping during application will not cause 
lap marks

• Lightly sand any stains or blemishes on wood 
before applying oil

TIPS ON PROPER
APPLICATION
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