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it’s a sign
Find your perfect cabinet knobs with a little help from the zodiac.  

A knob in serene deep ocean blue 
recalls all the places you’ve visited—
and those yet to be explored.

Imagination rules your house, Scorpio. 
Where others see just a blur of colors, 
you perceive endless possibilities.

The ginkgo leaf is a sign of resilience 
and longevity. Smart of you, intelligent 
Aquarius, to keep it around. 

Your taste for the finer things in life 
is clear throughout your home. This 
jewelry-like brass knob will fit right in.

You never shy away from showing  
your emotions. Why not wear your 
heart on more than just your sleeve?

The scales are your symbol, and 
orderly plaid exemplifies the balance 
you crave in life, and in decor. 

As a savvy manager, you excel at 
helping others shine. A sunburst knob 
will suit you perfectly. 

You’ve always been a confident 
leader, so you shouldn’t be afraid 
to show your stripes! 

You’re a skilled nester who often 
looks to the past for inspo. A retro 
oversize flower feels so right for you.

Your creative streak explains why 
Pisces is also known as the Dreamer 
sign. Embrace it! 

Ever optimistic, your outlook in life is 
that everything works out and gets 
tied up neatly in a bow.

Rational Virgos know a 50/50 mix is 
the logical answer to the plain-versus- 
patterned hardware debate.

PRODUCED BY KATE DOHERTY

Basketweave 
knob, $4,  
houzz.com

Sun knob,  
$9.50, queenie 
craftsshop.etsy.com

Blue Resin 
knob, $6, 
marktsq.com

Daisy knob, $22, 
sazeracstitches.com

Graphic Warning 
knob, $14, 
retrodollhouse 
.etsy.com

A/A Ginkgo Leaf 
knobs, $24  
for 2, amazon.com

Heart knob, $10, 
crateandbarrel.com

Menotti knob,  
$17, signature 
hardware.com

Sleeping Fox 
knobs, $24 for 2, 
anthropologie.com

Silver Bow 
knobs,  
$27 for 6,  
wayfair.com

Pink with 
Gold knob, 
$8, darosa-
creations.com

Horizon knob, $19,  
hapnyhome.com 
for stores

Libra Sept 23–Oct 22

Capricorn Dec 22–Jan 19

Aries Mar 21–Apr 19

Cancer June 21–July 22

Scorpio Oct 23–Nov 21

Aquarius Jan 20–Feb 18

Taurus Apr 20–May 20

Sagittarius Nov 22–Dec 21

Pisces Feb 19–Mar 20

Gemini May 21–June 20

Virgo Aug 23–Sept 22Leo July 23–Aug 22

horoscope
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