
Wedding FAQs  


Number of Guests 

We have a minimum guest requirement of 120 


Canapé Reception  

We love canapes, they are so important. Often guests arrive starving, rarely having had time for 
lunch, dashing to make the church on time. A glass of Champagne and some sustenance is essential. 
We know they put everyone in a great mood.  

For a 1.5 hour reception, we recommend a choice of 6-7 different canapés. Prices start form £15 per 
person.  


The Menu  

Prices from £40 for 2 courses and £50 for 3 courses, including 2 side dishes.  


Booking  

If you wish to book your Event with us, we ask you to fill in a booking form, send a deposit of 
£2,000 (inc vat), and sign and return our terms and conditions. Six weeks before the wedding an 
invoice for approx. 90% of the final costs minus deposit will be sent, including all hire, staffing and 
any other costs incurred.  


Remaining costs will be sent in the weeks after your wedding with any outstanding costs including 
removal of rubbish etc and any breakage charges.  


Tastings 

Most clients come to us on recommendation or having attended one of our weddings. For those of 
you who don’t know us and would like extra reassurance we do offer tastings under these terms.  


• Monday to Friday lunch times only 

• Not in July and August

• £300 per couple reduced to £150 if you book with us

• We will produce a selection of canapés and 2 courses

• Price includes 2-4 people, and we charge £50 for every extra person

• Tastings are subject to availability  


In Between Times  

Fee is on hand to help and advise with any queries you might have. With over 20 years experience 
catering in Cornwall there is very little we haven’t encountered, overcome, and have a solution to. It 
is imperative that to us that once the day arrives you can totally relax.  
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Site Visit  

We will visit you on site the day before the wedding to run through any last-minute changes and to 
begin setting up the catering tent, check hire and drinks etc. We will have a hold on the weather 
which can play its part, although not a big one! The aim being that on the day you know we have a 
hold on every detail, and you do not need to worry about a thing. 

The staff arrive 3-4 hrs before the reception. This allows plenty of time to lay tables, chill and 
organise drinks needed before, during, and after dinner, clear up and have a team meeting to run 
through the day. Most staff stay until an hour or two after dinner when it is generally at its busiest. 
Once the bar and late food staff are happy, the majority will leave. The rest stay until close. There 
will be a final clear down, the marquee closed up and power turned off before they leave.  


Hire

We will organise the hire of all kit needed for the catering tent as well as all glass, china, cutlery, 
linen, fire extinguishers etc. This will be delivered the day before the event and generally be 
removed after the weekend. Hire is approximately £17 per head.


Waste & Recycling 

We organise the bins to site and clearance after the event. Average cost approx £100.  


Chiller Trailer 

£325 plus VAT including delivery and collection, this is essential for the day.  


Details  

Catering tent: This is usually supplied by the marquee company who also typically supply tables for 
seating, coffee, catering tent, cake etc, plus chairs. We will liaise with them about power and 
catering tent size. A site visit is essential in order to understand access, location, water supplies etc. 
Please allow room for us to park at least one van beside the catering tent. 


Dietary Requirements 

We ask for a comprehensive list of guests with specific dietary requirements. We ask politely that 
this list does not reference likes and dislikes, making it harder for out team to look after those with 
specific needs. The nature of outside catering means that we cannot guarantee the absence of cross 
contamination. 


Children 

We will treat under 10’s separately to adults. They rarely want to sit for long so do bear this in 
mind. A picnic tea during the reception works well. Please can we have a family member, or good 
friend we can go to as a point of contact if needs be, we would never want to bother the bride or 
groom on the day.


Wedding Cake

Starting from £280 for a 2 tier, semi naked cake. 
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