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Just when you think that you have upgraded your computer and know how to make it work for 
you, there is something new in technology world. And with it comes a whole new language! 

Let's just talk for a few minutes about one of the newest social media phenomena called 
TWITTER. You become involved by signing up for a free account at Twitter.com. This allows 
you to upload a picture of yourself and enter information into your profile. You have to consider 
what and how much you want to share with the world because once it is on the internet you are 
vulnerable to the world. 

Perhaps you will want to "lurk" for a bit to learn what to do on Twitter. That means that you will 
watch what others are saying and doing. You can search for people who have the same 
geographic location, interests or just enter a "keyword" that will show you the options available. 

Once you find a "peep" (person) who you want to learn about you will "follow" that person. This 
allows you to receive all of the "tweets" that person creates. A "tweet" is a message that is 140 
characters or less that is randomly written by the "peep" you are following. 

It is generally considered to be polite to "follow" those who follow you - a courtesy but, you can 
"unfollow" at any time. 

As you develop your list of followers you will communicate somewhat as you would at a cocktail 
party with each person contributing their ideas and thoughts in short sentences. A tweet might 
be a statement, quotation or reference to a website or report. 

What gets kind of crazy is that as more and more people follow you, the conversation becomes 
so rapid that you cannot keep up. You then can help to sort things out through tools like 
TweetDeck which sorts your peeps into groups. Other applications provide methods of 
sophistication. For example, TweetLater allows you to enter tweets that will be sent out at 
designated times. Tweetpic gives you an opportunity to add photos to your tweets. And the list 
goes on. 

I opened a Twitter account in April and now have over 29,000 followers. There is absolutely no 
way that I could keep up with the conversations even if I wanted to do so. But I love it! 

One day I sent out a tweet that stated: "Twitter is kind of like having a party line in a small rural 
community. When you get the wrong number, you end up having a good conversation and 
making a good friend". This was retweeted by others several million times. Kind of makes you 
feel important! 

Social media is about connecting with others over the internet. Means you will never feel alone 
again. 

What a unique way to communicate with others. But first you have to learn the language. 

Well, I have to go now. Need to check my TweetDeck to see how many followers retweeting 
are. 

Did you tweet your peeps today? 

 


