


DEPARTURES BOARD

The Departures Board is a unique way to display your 
message that can be used to greet guests, share 
inspirational thoughts, or present a coffee shop menu. 

Inspired by traditional departure boards in airports and 
bus terminals, the magnetic letters make changing your 
message easy, and the aluminum and steel frame means 
the letter board will stand the test of time; making it the 
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The Departures Board is designed with a focus on quality, 
functionality, and longevity, to be used as a better way to 
display messages in your business.

Thank you for your purchase,
 
George & Willy



CARE GUIDE

Where you install your product depends on its material/s.

Wooden and Steel Products: We recommend using these 
products inside or under a shelter where they are 
protected from any exposure to rain or water. 

Aluminum Products: These products are non-corrosive 
and suitable for use outside. 

Chalk Products: You should use traditional dry chalk. We 
don't recommend using liquid chalk pens on our products. 

Transportable Outdoor Signage: If there is exposure to 
wind, we recommend bringing signage inside to protect it 
from the extremes. We offer Sandbags to help support 
your product in moderate wind conditions.



COMPONENTS

1 x Board

 6 x Screws

1 x Letter Magnet Pack

A B C D

O P Q R

3 4 5 6



1

r��Ù��ËÄÄ�Å��ąú¬Å¤�ä©��Ý�Ù�õÝ�¬ÅäË���Ýäé��äË�Ý�£�¾û�
secure the board to the wall.



2
400mm

775mm

We recommend you use a level to ensure the board is 
straight and mark this with a pencil. Fix the screws into the 
wall. 
Tip: Don’t screw completely into the wall. Remember to 
leave enough of the head out so that the board can slide 
into the keyholes. For extra support also mount screws at 
the bottom.
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Slide screws into keyholes. 



If you have a large message/menu, you can join several 
Departures Boards side by side or, mix up a wall display by 
pairing with some of our other board products.
Display your words with the magnet letter packs, have fun 
+ get creative!
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DISCLAIMER
George & Willy products have a lifetime warranty. This 
covers faulty workmanship and/or materials when the 
product is used in normal, domestic, or commercial 
conditions and following the care and use instructions 
provided. 

It does not cover normal wear and tear, accidents, or 
Ä¬ÝéÝ��Ë£�ä©��ÖÙË�é�äķ�r��Ù��ËÄÄ�Å��éÝ¬Å¤���Øé�¾¬ą���
builder to complete the installation to reduce the risk of 
damage or injury. If the defect was caused by a 
manufacturing fault, the faulty product will be replaced 
free of charge. If the original product is no longer in 
production, it will be replaced with the most similar 
product.

Please keep all parts out of reach of small children as 
they may pose a choking risk.



CONTACT US

sales@georgeandwilly.com

www.georgeandwilly.com

@georgeandwilly

www.pinterest.com/georgeandwilly/


