
 

        Guten Morgen!   Good Morning! 
                  

                  Wir freuen uns Sie als Frühstücksgast zu haben 

                und werden uns bemühen, Sie zufrieden zu stellen. 

                                                       *** 

               We are happy to have you as our guest this morning, 

                 and hope your visit will be a wonderful experience. 

 

Country Morning Breakfast  

Scrambled Eggs and Ham on a fresh baked croissant.  
 

Bauern Frühstück (Farmer’s Breakfast) 

Two Eggs (Any Style*) served with your choice of either 
Kassler Rippchen (smoked pork chop) or Leberkäse 
(Bavarian Beef and Pork Loaf) and Roasted Potatoes.  
 

German Potato Pancakes  

Homemade potato pancakes (3) served with apple sauce. 
 

Homemade Corned Beef Hash  

Served with 2 Eggs (any style)* and rolls.  
 

Bacon Onion Hash  

Bacon and onion chopped fine and sautéed combined 
with hash brown potatoes and over baked with cheddar 
jack cheese. Topped with 2 eggs (any style*) and rolls.  
 

Veggie Hash  

Sautéed zucchini, yellow squash, red peppers, onions and 
mushrooms, combined with hash brown potatoes and over 
baked with cheddar jack cheese. Topped with 2 Eggs (any 
style)* and rolls.  
 

Ham & Cheese Omelet  

Traditional Omelet, served with sliced of grilled cheese 
bread from our bakery. A real treat!  
 

Farmer’s Omelet  

Omelet made with onions, ham, green peppers, and 
tomatoes.  
 

Veggie Omelet  

Omelet made with Sautéed zucchini, yellow squash, red 
peppers, onions and mushrooms.  
 

Pregel & Lox (Smoked Scottish Salmon)  

Our own special Bagel served with premium smoked 
salmon, cream cheese, onions, capers and tomato.  
 

Apfelküchle  

Sliced apples dipped in batter, pan fried and sprinkled with 
cinnamon sugar.  Topped with whipped cream 
 

 

 

Health Dept. Advisory: 

Consuming raw or undercooked Meat or Eggs may be hazardous to your health. 

 

*Due to time constraints, soft or hard boiled eggs are not available. 

 

Mountain Climber’s Breakfast  

Two Eggs (any style*) with grits or roast potatoes, ham or 
sausage links, and rolls.  
 

Hofer’s Morning Delight  

A favorite for years! Scrambled eggs with ham and 
choice of American or Swiss cheese served on grilled 
Buttercrust bread from our bakery 
 

Bavarian Cold Cut Breakfast  

German cold cuts (smoked ham, jägerwurst, gelbwurst, 
and mild cheese).  Served with fresh baked bread and 
rolls from our bakery.  
 

Alpine French Toast  

Hofer’s Buttercrust bread, thick sliced, dipped in egg 
batter and grilled to perfection.  Served with syrup and 
whipped cream  
 

Hofer’s Belgian Waffle  

Our malted waffle is extra thick, served with syrup and 
whipped cream. (Pecan, Strawberry, or Blueberry)  
 

Hofer’s Biscuits & German Gravy 

Creamy Nuremberg Bratwurst Gravy over  

two fresh baked Buttermilk Biscuits.  
 

 

Breakfast Side Orders 
 

 

 

Roasted Potatoes …                     

Stone Ground Nora Mill Grits …  

Fresh Baked Butter Croissant …                        

Buttermilk Biscuit  …                     

Toast (White, Rye)  …                     

Sausage Links …                            

Ham …                                              

Corned Beef Hash …                      

Kassler (Smoked Pork Chop) …  

Egg any style*        (One egg) …  

                                 (Two eggs) …  

Muffins (Blueberry or Cranberry Nut) …  

Bread Plate … 
Bread Basket … 

 

 

 

 


