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Introduction:
The Spiritual History of Mankind

 
 

How did Satan manage to move through history undetected 
and maintain his hold on mankind? Why did those who 
knew of his deception in the Garden of Eden continue to 
uphold his desires to interfere in God’s plan? These 
witnesses knew firsthand of the consequences and 
punishment God placed on anyone choosing to follow the 
agenda of Satan and the Fallen Angels. From living in a 
peaceful paradise, wanting for nothing, to toiling in the dirt 
just to survive. What makes worshipping Satan so appealing 
that generations have been willing to trade Heaven for Hell 
by choosing to follow him and his rebellion against the God 
who created all things?
 
What you are about to read is somewhat of a detective story 
that investigates ancient history and pieces together a wide 
variety of all the links that have brought the ‘Agenda of 
Satan’ through the ages to establish his final blow to 
mankind—the Antichrist. Many events have been hidden 
from those who do not understand Satan’s crusaders. My 
objective is to expose their hidden agenda to the world so 
those who hear this message will not be deceived by these 
illuminated beings who originated from Satan’s seed in the 
Garden of Eden. Many sons of Satan, who have been 
initiated into his Plan, serve today in positions of great 
power. They are the movers and shakers behind 
governments, financial institutions, religions, policies, 
research, medicine, education, technology, news media, etc. 



22

Illuminated beings have been with us since the Garden of 
Eden, weaving their web of control, destruction, and deceit 
among the Children of God.
 
The hidden agenda, untold to the Children of God, is for 
Satan’s purpose. He wants to take every soul he can acquire 
before his final battle with God at Armageddon. Satan must 
keep luring people to his side, because as they die they are 
no longer any help to him at this final conflict. Throughout 
this book, I will expose Satan’s Plan. I will put to rest his 
ancient conspiracy, which has been designed to confuse 
those who want to follow the True God, our Creator and 
Lord—JEHOVAH—and His Son, Jesus Christ.
 
Our recorded history, from the very beginning, shows that 
civilizations have venerated the Serpent while others have 
abhorred it. In the earliest known civilizations of 
Mesopotamia, Sumer, and Egypt, the Serpent/Dragon was a 
sacred being. The Celtics of England used the Dragon as the 
symbol of their ultimate sovereignty. The Greeks believed 
Dragons were creatures that held the wisdom and 
knowledge of the true secrets to immortality. These 
Dragons were said to be spiritual and appeared in the form 
of Sea Serpents.
 
In direct opposition to these aforementioned beliefs, were 
the Christian and Hebrew concepts of Serpents. Christianity 
portrays the Serpent as the evil archangel who opposed God 
and brought about the fall of mankind. This is directly 
opposite of cult lore that says Lucifer was an enlightener 
and friend to mankind. It is in this opposition, between 
parallel histories and beliefs, that we will discover the real 
Truth. The Deceiver will be exposed!
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The Earth and all that is, did not come from chaos. God’s 
plan was perfect. Unfortunately, as God gathered His host 
of Heaven together, Lucifer became angry and jealous. He 
lashed out at God, because he wanted to be equal to God. 
Selfish sin overcame Lucifer and eternal division was 
forced into existence. God did not want this division, but 
Lucifer rebelled and chose his own agenda. Therefore, God 
removed Lucifer and his followers from Heaven by casting 
them out for all eternity. They can never return.
 
In the meantime, God’s creation of Adam and Eve was His 
delight. He placed them within the Garden of Eden so they 
would always have everything they would ever need. God’s 
presence was in the Garden and He carefully instructed 
them. Satan was furious when he saw the beauty of Adam 
and Eve, who, unlike him, were created in God’s Own 
Image. The anger boiled inside Satan, and with his sin of 
jealousness he attacked earth.
 
God told Adam and Eve that they were created in His 
Image. He explained the need to stay away from the Tree of 
Knowledge, as it would bring them death. Satan watched, 
but he felt that Adam and Eve should be allowed to see both 
his and God’s side of things. Therefore, Satan deceitfully 
used their innocence to entice them to do evil. He tempted 
Eve, and on that day, Christianity’s foe, Gnosticism (evil), 
was born. At that moment, Adam and Eve’s faith, their total 
trust in God Supreme, became infiltrated by Gnosticism, 
which was composed of secret knowledge, love of self and 
following Satan, who appeared to enlighten.
 
Life became a great chess game between the powers of 
good and evil. Gnosticism’s promise of enlightenment gave 
mankind building strength; but in the end, it will bring 
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sorrow. Knowledge gave mankind awareness of the ability 
to choose. Unfortunately, the penalty for not making the 
right choice results not only in physical death due to sin, as 
all mankind are sinners, but in eternal death to those that 
follow evil and do not choose to repent of their sin.

To those choosing to follow the will of God, the path of 
Christianity brings not an easier life, but the promise of 
resurrection and an eternity with our Creator. As Christians, 
we are all sinners, but it is through our faith in Jesus that we 
receive His grace and mercy, which washes us clean of our 
sin. Even though we are cleansed, we still have to die to 
inherit our reward into eternal life, unless we are caught up 
in the Rapture at the ‘End of the Age’ and are changed into 
our spiritual bodies in the blink of an eye.
 
The Gnostics believe through their power, control, and self-
illumination that they will attain the keys to overcome 
earthly death and avoid eternal judgment. Throughout time, 
they have invested great energy in teaching their initiates 
that through the sacred mysteries they will become as god 
and reap immortality. Woe to the people of this deception, 
because it means an eternity without God. On the other 
hand, for Christians, ours is just a little sorrow of suffering 
on Earth, but with a wonderful promise of an eternity with 
God, our Father.
 
The wicked seeds of Satan, throughout history, have 
somewhat controlled humanity through various aspects of 
our daily life. Long ago, Gnostic sects conceived a plan to 
make themselves into an undercover organization. They 
made sure this mystery organization would not be subject to 
the ups and downs and uncertainties of political and social 
change that would occur throughout the ages. It is separate 



   25

from all governments, but it indirectly controls them all. 
These wicked men have allowed an alternative history to be 
written that keeps mankind from the Creator. By secretly 
controlling history, they have manipulated how people view 
the past. This deceptive misinformation will be what they 
will use to massively influence how mankind accepts the 
future. It is a cleverly devised trap!
 
Many Christian Saints have been placed along the way to 
warn us about this deception. But their warnings have fallen 
on deaf ears. The problem has been mankind’s inability to 
distinguish between Gnosticism and true Christianity. This 
is part of Satan’s strategy. He wants to have his Agenda so 
close to Christianity that no one can be sure of what is truth. 
The more we look to the created for our answers and heed 
their words of wisdom, the less we search the Bible and 
pray to our Creator, Jehovah, for guidance. What a cleverly 
devised plan of deception! The Gnostics and their father, 
Satan, will soon present a man to the world who will appear 
to be the Messiah. This Beast will, seemingly, have the 
answer to all of mankind’s greatest needs. The masses will 
embrace this so-called savior, without questioning whether 
he is God or Satan. This enormous acceptance of the future 
Antichrist will bring about the ‘End of the Ages.’ It will 
unleash the final battle between good and evil. The battle is 
known, prophetically, as that of Armageddon.
 
The history you are about to read will uncover Satan’s plot 
to remove Jehovah as the good God and replace him with a 
false Messiah, the Antichrist. You will be led on a journey 
that proves, since Eden, that Satan has been in the 
background deceiving mankind. Satan’s agnostic religion 
changes Jehovah from an honest God to a dishonest God. 
Gnosticism boldly teaches that Jehovah is responsible for 
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keeping mankind in darkness through ‘His Acts of Wrath.’ 
It goes on to inform that Lucifer was true to man and had 
mankind’s best interest at stake when he offered the 
forbidden fruit of knowledge to Eve in the Garden of Eden. 
Satan’s enticement to eat the fruit opened Adam and Eve’s 
innocent eyes from, what Agnostics term, ‘ignorant 
darkness’ and, in turn, gave them spiritual enlightenment. 
This form of false religion continues to deceitfully win the 
hearts of mankind, because it offers alternatives, tolerance, 
love of self, possible keys to obtaining earthly immortality, 
and the achievement of god-like wisdom without 
contemplating that there will be a ‘Day of Judgment’ for 
their souls.
 
Many have wondered, throughout the course of history, as 
to how Satan will manifest himself as the Messiah. His Plan 
is quite clever. Bible prophecy warns that he will deceive 
the whole earth and become mankind’s false savior at the 
‘End of the Age.’ The coming of the Antichrist is imminent. 
Of immediate concern is the fact that many, unknowingly, 
may be participating in Satan’s agenda through their 
membership with various secret organizations. This book is 
a sound warning to unyoke yourself from these ritualistic 
and pagan practices now, before it is too late. From this day 
forward, no reader of this book will ever be able to stand 
before God and say, “No one told me that I was being 
deceived.” You have been warned!

“And God spake all these words, saying “I am the Lord thy 
God, which have brought thee out of the land of Egypt, out 
of the house of bondage. THOU SHALT HAVE NO 
OTHER GODS BEFORE ME.” (Exodus 20:1–3).
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The First Commandment, “Thou shalt have no other gods 
before me,” is the premises, ‘the central theme and basis of 
argument,’ for this very unique book. I believe God, over 
many years and through many trials, has prepared me to 
write it for this generation, because we are the terminal 
generation. It is my sincerest prayer that the reading of this 
research will offer each individual a better understanding of 
the fact that the ‘End of the Age’ is close at hand. It is 
important to me that all of God’s People, who He created in 
His Own Image, realize the evil forces that have brought us 
to this prophesied moment in time.
 
“Beware of False Prophets, which come to you in sheep’s 
clothing, but inwardly they are ravening wolves.” (Matthew 
7:15).
Our blessed hope of deliverance from the evil lineage of 
Cain and his father, Satan, will come soon. So:
“Watch ye therefore: for ye know not when the master of 
the house cometh (Jesus), at even, or at midnight, or at the 
cockcrowing, or in the morning: Lest coming suddenly he 
find you sleeping. And what I say unto you I say unto all, 
Watch.” (Mark 13:35–37, Parenthetical comment mine).
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