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Baking our planet a better place!

2oz Vegan Chocolate Chip Cookie Dough

Ingredients: Enriched wheat flour (wheat flour, 
malted barley flour, niacin, reduced iron, 
thiamine mononitrate, riboflavin, folic acid), 
chocolate chips (sugar, unsweetened 
chocolate, cocoa butter, vanilla, salt), sugar, 
coconut oil, water, humectant (rice syrup, 
grape juice), sunflower oil, cornstarch, 
molasses, sunflower lecithin, salt, baking soda, 
garbanzo bean flour. CONTAINS WHEAT.

2oz Vegan Birthday Cake Cookie Dough

Ingredients: Enriched wheat flour (Wheat flour, 
malted barley flour, niacin, reduced iron, 
thiamine mononitrate, riboflavin, folic acid), 
sugar, coconut oil, rainbow sprinkles (sugar, 
palm kernel & palm oil, cornstarch, vegetable 
juice, sunflower lecithin, annatto extract, 
spirulina extract, turmeric, beta-carotene, 
paprika, maltodextrin, carnauba wax, cellulose 
gum) water, humectant (rice syrup, grape 
juice), sunflower oil, cornstarch, sunflower 
lecithin, natural cake batter flavor, salt, baking 
soda, garbanzo bean flour. CONTAINS WHEAT.

2oz Vegan Double Chocolate Chip Cookie 
Dough

Ingredients: Enriched wheat flour (Wheat flour, 
malted barley flour, niacin, reduced iron, 
thiamine mononitrate, riboflavin, folic acid), 
sugar, chocolate chips (sugar, unsweetened 
chocolate, cocoa butter, vanilla, salt) coconut 
oil, water, cocoa processed with alkali, 
humectant (rice syrup, grape juice), sunflower 
oil, cornstarch, molasses, sunflower lecithin, 
salt, baking soda, garbanzo bean flour. 
CONTAINS WHEAT.
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