
V I N TAG E  2 02 0

F R O M  T H E  L A N D :

The fruit was sourced from a 
selection of vineyards across 
Marlborough's Wairau and 
Southern Valleys.

A combination of Chardonnay 
clones were carefully selected, 
made up of predominantly Clone 
6.

Each vineyard was carefully 
monitored and the grapes 
harvested upon reaching the 
desired flavour spectrum and 
maturity.

T O  T H E  W I N E RY: 

2020 was a fantastic vintage, 
with a small crop of intensly 
flavoured grapes.

The grapes were machine 
harvested and transported 
promptly to the winery to be 
lightly pressed.

The juice was lightly settled, 
racked, then cool fermented 
with selected yeasts in stainless 
steel tanks and seasoned oak.

After malolactic fernentation, 
the wine was aged for nine 
months prior to Heather 
selecting her preferred blend for 
bottling.

2 0 2 0

C H A R D O N N AY

MARLBOROUGH NEW ZEALAND WINE

TASTING NOTE 

NOSE: AROMAS OF RIPE WHITE PEACH AND TROPICAL FRUITS WITH 

A HINT OF LEMON CURD AND FRESHLY BAKED BISCUITS.

PALATE:  A ROUND LUSCIOUS PALATE SHOWING NOTES OF FRESH 

STONE FRUIT AND LEMON ZEST, WITH LAYERS OF BISCUIT AND 

PASTRY ON THE SAVOURY FINISH.

2020 RIVER DELTA 
CHARDONNAY

W I N E M A K E R

AC I D I T Y

Heather Stewart

5.9 g/L Vegetarian Friendly

A L C O H O L

13%

3.3g/L

P H

3.41

R E S I D UA L  S U G A R
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