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n 1991 Lynette 
Lovelace opened a restaurant outside Chicago. 
a cozy bistro that also sold high-end cloth-
ing, kafe kokopelli was a local favorite. 
then in 2001, the unthinkable happened: 
Lovelace’s 2-year-old son, Logan, was diag-
nosed with a life-threatening liver abscess 
that required major surgery. Lovelace spent 
September 11 at his hospital bedside, watch-
ing the twin towers fall on television as the 
boy’s fever climbed to 107. “i had no ability 
to process what the rest of the world was 
going through,” she admits. 

as Logan recovered, Lovelace juggled car-
ing for him with the demands of her busi-
ness, which she moved in 2005 to a larger 
space and rechristened Embrace, eventually 
hiring a staff of 50. but in 2008 came more 
terrible news: her 12-year-old daughter, 
kenna, had a brain tumor. Suddenly the 
family was back at the hospital—and in the 
most terrifying kind of limbo. but Lovelace 
tried to remain upbeat, whether by writing 
in her journal or wearing a soothing scent. 
“When my son was sick, our pediatrician 
told my husband and me that we could 
choose whether to give up or stay strong,” 
Lovelace says. “i always remembered that.” 

the Christmas after kenna’s successful 
surgery, Lovelace felt overwhelmed with 
gratitude—and ready for a change. She de-
cided that her next venture, in addition to 
allowing her more time at home, would  

I
promote the healing powers of a positive at-
titude. “there is positivity in all of us,” she 
says. “Sometimes we just need a little some-
thing to bring it out.” a self-professed prod-
uct junkie, Lovelace began working with a 
local chemist on a line of fragrances that 
would spark pleasant memories and conjure 
far-flung fantasies, helping wearers take 
charge of their outlook. She used her savings 
to painstakingly source ingredients, partner-
ing with a manufacturer to produce a per-
fume, body wash, scrub, lotion, and creams. 
in 2009 she bid a teary goodbye to Embrace’s 

staff. then she started cold-calling retailers 
like henri bendel—and was soon in new 
york showcasing her brand, Lifetherapy, at 
one of the store’s popular trunk shows. 

now Lovelace’s line is sold all over the 
country, but it has made the biggest differ-
ence at home, where she says she relishes 
weekends “lying around in my pajamas with 
my kids”—both now healthy. “a body wash 
won’t change anyone’s life,” Lovelace says, 
“but it can boost your mood. i want to share 
what a little determination and positivity 
can do.”  —arianna davis

Lynette Lovelace closed her bistro to launch a beauty line 
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